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eShoe PLAYER INFORMATION NHPA TRADING CARD SETS

If you happen to see this gentleman around the 
Event Center, his name is Mr. Bob Bloss from 
Missouri. You will see him in a wide variety of fun 
hats. If you see him,  ask him to take a photo with 
you. 

FUN& UNIQUE HATS

Jim Kinney, the NHPA secretary/treasurer would 
like to ask all Membership Directors, Secretary/
Treasurers to please update your members contact 
information including phone numbers, email 
addresses, mailing addresses in the E-shoe program.

During this world tournament we have several 
people that we have needed to contact and found 
invalid (non-working) phone numbers, mailing 
addresses not correct, etc. We greatly appreciate 
your assistance with this update. 

Stop by the Monroe, LA booth and pick up your 
information for the 2022 World Tournament. There 
will be lots of fun activities including tours of the 
Duck Dynasty warehouse and much more. 

You can make your RV/Camping Reservations as 
well as your Hotel reservations now. The contact 
phone numbers and information is on the brochures.

We have sets of the 2020 NHPA trading cards 
available at the NHPF Booth for a special World 
Tournament price of $70.00 per set. If you want a 
single set, the price is $20.00 per set. 

You can also go to the NHPA website and make 
your purchase online for any of the new 2021 sets 
that will be available in October. These make great 
collectibles and gift sets for any occasion.   

There will be special cards available in these sets, so 
start trading and collecting today. 

https://www.neptuneisland.com/


RD, STATE OFFICERS
 & SANCTIONED 

LEAGUE MEETINGS 
The Regional Director and State Officers Meeting 
will be held on Friday July 23, 2021 beginning 
promptly at 2:00 p.m. in the Event Center Exhibit 
Hall (Shoe Check Building). 

STAT ROOM 
You can sign up to keep score and judge at the 
NHPA Stat Room office. You can earn $15.00 per 
shift. Sign up sheets are on the table outside of the 
Stat Room, located in the main isle of 
Winnemucca Event Center.  

If you would like a copy of your tournament 
results, you will receive a free copy after your 3 
day preliminary tournament. If you choose to 
request a daily copy of your results, the charge 
will be $1.00 per copy. 

The NHPA council would like to  encourage 
everyone to stay hydrated. While temperatures can 
increase to more than 100 degrees, it is important 
to keep the whole family hydrated while enjoying 
summer activities. Hydration is particularly 
important for children, as they have higher water 
requirements in relation to their body weight than 
adults. 

Children don’t always recognize the early stages of 
thirst which can make them particularly 
vulnerable to becoming dehydrated, especially 
during times that can drive up their body fluid 
losses, like when they are playing sports or during 
warm weather. 

Drink up: Do not wait until you are thirsty to start 
hydrating.  Drink two to four glasses of water each 
hour.  If you are exercising for an extended period 
of time, drink a sports beverage to replace the salt 
and minerals you lose through sweat. If you are on 
diuretics, or a low-salt or fluid-restricted diet, talk 
to your doctor first about your specific fluid needs.

HYDRATE

For all of the latest news, "Live Streaming" coverage on the 2021 World Tournament please check out 
the NHPA website.

https://www.horseshoepitching.com  

WHAT IS BEMER? 

BEMER, which stands for Bio Electro Magnetic 
Energy Regulation, includes a full-body mat and 
accessories, and is a revolutionary medical 
technology that has been shown to stimulate 
your body's natural systems, to restore your 
energy, improve your health, and reduce the 
discomfort of those nagging conditions. Chronic 
health conditions can cause a wide range of 
symptoms, including pain, fatigue, and more. 
Pulsed electromagnetic field (PEMF) therapy has 
been used as a treatment option to help alleviate 
the symptoms of some of these conditions.

Stop by David's booth and try out the chairs. 
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